
Call for Artists!!! 
 

Biannual Advent Art Show 
 

2024 Exhibition Theme:  
 

“The Light Shines in the Darkness--Love conquers all.” 

Featured artist: John Warr 
 

Exhibition Location:  Saint Luke’s Episcopal Church, Scottsboro, AL 35768 
 

Exhibition Dates: Dec. 8th, 2024 to Jan. 12th, 2025 
 

Deadline for submission: November 21st, 2024 
 

Public Art Reception: December 15th, 2024, 5 p.m. 
 
 
 

Guidelines: 
 

The exhibition is open to all artists over the age of 16 who live in Alabama or an adjacent state.   
 

Submission is free. All entries must be original works of art.  Artwork submission must be 
accompanied by a submission form.  
 

The exhibition accepts all 2–3-dimensional works in abstract, non-representational, or 
representational are welcome.  Acceptable mediums include Acrylic, Ceramics, Charcoal, 
Collage, Color Pencil, Computer Art, Digital Art, Digital Photography, Drawings, Encaustic, Fiber 
Arts, Glass Art, Graphite, Gouache, Illustration, Mixed Media, Oil, Pastel, Pen and Ink, Photo 
Assemblage, Printmaking, Sculpture, Traditional Photography, or Watercolor.  
 

The dimension of each artwork cannot exceed 6 ft x 6 ft x 6ft.  
 

Selling and Promoting Artworks 
 

Saint Luke’s will not conduct sales or take profit of any artwork sales on the behalf of artist. If 
an artist wants to sell their artwork, they must label the artwork as for sale.  If a buyer is 
interested, Saint Luke’s will be happy to pass along the buyer’s information to the artist; all 
business must be conducted outside of the show.   
 

If an artist wants to promote their artwork, they may add additional information below the 
artwork label such as website and contact info. 

 



Delivery of the Artwork:  
 

Artists must deliver their artwork in person to Saint Luke’s church between November 17th-21st 
during church business hours.  Please call ahead 256-574-6216 before delivering the artwork. 
All artwork submissions must be delivered in person or mailed to Saint Luke’s no later than 
November 27th to be considered in the show.  
 

All artworks must be received by the rector, Polly Robb, at Saint Luke’s. Each artwork must be 
accompanied by a completed and signed entry form.  
 

All artworks must be ready to be installed. Saint Luke’s reserves the right not to display an 
artwork if it is not ready for installation.  
 

Saint Luke’s reserves the right to refuse any submission for any reason and to photograph and 
reproduce images of exhibited work for publicity purposes. 

Saint Luke’s will take every precaution against damage or theft of artwork but will not be 
responsible for damage or loss whatever the cause. 

Artwork return is the total, financial responsibility of the individual artist.  

 

Return and Pick Up of Artwork 

All artworks must be collected from Saint Luke’s between January 12th to January 26th, 2025.  

If the artist is picking up the artwork at Saint Luke’s, they must contact 256-574-6216 ahead of 
time to schedule a pickup date and time.  

If the artwork must be mailed back to the artist, the artist is responsible to provide the mailing 
package and postage fee.   

If artwork is not collected by January 26th, 2025, the artist must contact Polly to let Saint Luke’s 
know whether they want the artwork to be donated.   

Any artwork that is not picked up by January 31st, 2025, the artworks will become the property 
of Saint Luke’s and will be donated for a good cause.  

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Saint Luke’s Biannual Advent Journey Art Show 

INTENTION TO PARTICIPATE 
I intend to participate in Saint Luke’s Advent Journey. 

 
 

Name of Artist:___________________________________________________________ 
 
Contact Information 
 

Home Address:            
 
             

 
             

 
Email:            
 

Phone Number:          
 

Artist’s preferred medium:        
 

 
Short Artist Bio/ Artist Statement/ Website: (for promotion purposes)  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thank you for offering your work to this show. You may send this form to us at the address 
below or scan it and send to our email address: rector@stlukesscottsboro.com 
 
We will reach out to you closer to the show to ask you for a short description of your piece, and 
to share if you would, what thinking led you to interpret the theme as you did.  
 
 

Artist Signature: _______________________________  Date:__________________ 

mailto:rector@stlukesscottsboro.com

